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The Advent of TRiO Programs 
 
 
 
Since their establishment in the mid-sixties as part of Lyndon Johnson’s War on Poverty 

Program, the federal TRiO Programs have attempted to provide educational opportunity 

to help Americans overcome class and social barriers to higher education.  The TRIO 

programs are funded under Title IV of the Higher Education Act of 1965. While student 

financial aid programs help students overcome financial barriers to higher education, TRIO 

programs help students overcome class, social and cultural barriers to higher education. 

There are eight TRiO programs including: Upward Bound, Talent Search, Student Support 

Services, Veterans Upward Bound, Educational Opportunity Centers, Upward Bound Math 

& Science, the Ronald E. McNair Post-Baccalaureate Achievement Program, and a training 

program for TRiO staff.  

 

There are more than 150 McNair programs across the United States and Puerto Rico, 

serving over 4,000 undergraduates.  The McNair Scholars Program has been at Lamar since 

1999 and has seen over 200 graduates attend over 30 different graduate programs across 



The Life of Ronald E. McNair 
 

 
 

Ronald Erwin McNair was born October 21, 1950, in Lake City, South Carolina, to Carl and 
Pearl McNair.  Although he grew up amidst crushing poverty, McNair always exhibited a deep 
thirst for scientific knowledge. In 1971, he graduated magna cum laude 



 
 
 

SCHEDULE OF 
PRESENTATIONS 

 
Session	

 
 Reaux 
 

 
  Room 104 
 

 

One Estrella Balderas Olivia Cobb	  

Two 

Three 

Kaitlin Ricks 

Vicky Longoria 

Kenzie Marriott 

Chloe Lopez 

 

Four 

Five 

Six 

Seven 

Eight 

Nine 

Matthew Flores 

Christie Luong	

Natalia Pulido Gonzalez 

Magda Soto 

Jerrica Francisco 

Nylah Vital- Predium 

 

Maci Simmons 

E.J. McMillen 

Drake Rothenberger 

Darlene Thomas 

Harvest Prater	

 

 

 

((



    

    



Session One 
 

Reaud	
Additive Nanoparticles for the Improvement of Mechanical  

and Anti-Bacterial Properties in Polyetheretherketone (PEEK) 
 

Estrella Balderas and Dr. Paul Bernazzani, Faculty Mentor 
 

The need to prevent the by-products and negative aesthetic effects of titanium dental implant 
corrosion has initiated a search for a possible alternative to titanium that can match the 
osseointegration, durability, and strength of the material. A suggested







Session Four 
 
Reaud	

An analysis of Airfoils at Hypersonic Speeds using CFD 
Matthew Flores, and Dr. Xianchang Li, Faculty Mentor 

This research was done to analyze the design and function of an airfoil operating under 
hypersonic conditions. This was done by using airfoils designed for both general low speed use 
and use under super critical conditions, then simulating them in Hypersonic conditions by using 
ANSYS-Fluent Workbench 24.0. Once these airfoils had been adequately simulated with various 
angle of attack values, they were analyzed to observe which had higher aerodynamic lift, and 
lower aerodynamic drag. This directly leads to a dec rease in the power needed to fly and thus an 
improvement in the aircraft’s efficiency. ANSYS-Fluent Workbench 24.0 was used for its ability 
to perform Computational fluid dynamics (CFD) analysis which gave us the lift and drag 
coefficient values for our simulations. The Mach Number (M) is used to denote how many times 
faster than sound an object is traveling. The parameters for Hypersonic flight are defined as flight 
that is 5 times faster than the speed of sound, or 1,715 meters per second (3,836.3 Mph). From the 
simulations, the shape of the airfoil and the angle of attack were observed to play major roles in 
the values of the lift and drag coefficients, and thus show what direction future designs should 
head to make hypersonic flight more efficient and a viable alternative to current forms of travel. 
 
Room 104	
 
The Queer Heroine’s Incomplete Journey in First-Wave Lesbian Literature 

 

Maci Simmons, and Dr. 



 
 
 
 
 

Session Five	

 
Reaud	
 

Nanotechnology: Novel Material Structures for Ferroelectrets 
	

Christie Luong, Dr. Robert Kelley Bradley, Faculty Mentor 
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This study examined interdisciplinary roles between speech and hearing- and nursing students 
toward care interventions for aphasia. Previous researchers discovered a significant contrast in 
competence between nursing and speech


